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Appendix 1- Tenant Satisfaction Measures 
National consultation on the Regulator of Social Housing’s proposals 

 

Consultation questions Task & Finish Group response 

 

Agree 

 

Agree 
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Disagree 

TP03 – The tenant’s response would only be focussed on the 
last repair, rather than any, or all, repairs they had received in 
last 12 months. In the current format the response to this 
question has the potential to be skewed by the tenant ignoring 
this request and commenting on a previous repair that may have 
been completed in less timely fashion, or their answer being 
prejudiced by that previous repair, even if the last repair was 
completed in timely fashion. 

Alternatively, should the tenant select the last repair to comment 
on it will not register any dissatisfaction with the performance of 
previous repairs completion in the last 12 months. 

 

Should the question therefore refer to the ‘Satisfaction with time 
taken to complete all repairs in the last 12 months’?  

 

RP02 – all landlords are likely to have differing completion 
targets; some could have harsher targets than others and could 
be penalised for stretching themselves. Should the regulator set 
an industry standard set of completion targets to ensure 
absolute consistency. 
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No 

There is likely to be discrepancies in the landlord response to 
RP01 Homes that do not meet the Decent Homes Standard due 
to the Decent Homes Guidance allowing for exclusion due to 
tenant refusals to upgrade homes. 

In addition, we believe it would be worthwhile collecting the 
number of exclusions for monitoring purposes, with a review of 
the findings by the Regulator in due course. 

 

Agree  

In addition, we believe it would be worthwhile collecting the 
number of expired gas safety checks for each landlord due to 
lack of access provided by the tenant, with a review of the 
findings by the Regulator in due course 
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No 

Whilst we understand why an Electric Servicing measure is 
missing at this stage, pending further consultation, we believe an 
interim measure could be added to the TSMs to monitor periodic 
electrical inspections of social housing properties every 5 years. 

 

Disagree 

We understand the context provided in the consultation 
documents and agree this will be a difficult measure to quantify 
given the small number of tenants who may pass through the 
corporate complaints process. However, we also believe the 
accuracy or the credibility of the survey result for this question 
will not necessarily give a fair reflection on a landlord where 
tenants have not raised a complaint or dissatisfaction. 

 

We suggest that the question reflects expressions of 
dissatisfaction as well as corporate complaints to avoid 
ambiguity to the tenant. 
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Yes 
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Yes 
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Yes 

 

Agree 

However, we would like to register a comment that there is much 
more context to the survey outcome performance figure of 
satisfaction here, as there are a number of variables including 
the fear/intimidation of reporting ASB, wanting only to act 
anonymously, wanting to report ASB but then not supporting 
further action, plus a majority of tenants who will never have 
cause to report ASB. 

On face value the resulting performance against this measure 
may not always give the full picture and further investigation into 
performance will be required. 
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No 

We do agree that the four measures provide a well-rounded view 
with one exception; that the outcomes of ASB cases should be 
measured and monitored to provide an additional perspective of 
performance than just the number of cases raised. This 
additional measure will place a greater focus on landlords to 
effectively tackle ASB cases. 

 

There are too few tenant satisfaction measures 

Whilst the TSMs cover a broad range of measures there are still 
some key landlord areas of responsibility not covered, such as 
how a landlord’s homes meet disability needs, how social 
mobility is supported to allow tenants to move within a Local 
Authority area due to a change in circumstances, how landlords 
support vulnerable households and how a landlord is performing 
in relation to rent collection. 

We also commented that there should be an additional measure 
recording the outcomes to ASB cases. 
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Yes 

Whilst the TSMs cover a broad range of measures there are still 
some key landlord areas of responsibility not covered, such as 
how a landlord’s homes meet disability needs, how social 
mobility is supported to allow tenants to move within a Local 
Authority area due to a change in circumstances, how landlords 
support vulnerable households and how a landlord is performing 
in relation to rent collection. 

We also commented that there should be an additional measure 
recording the outcomes to ASB cases. 

We do not consider that any measures should be removed. 

 

Partially 

Whilst the TSMs cover a broad range of measures there are still 
some key landlord areas of responsibility not covered, such as 
how a landlord’s homes meet disability needs, how social 
mobility is supported to allow tenants to move within a Local 
Authority area due to a change in circumstances, how landlords 
support vulnerable households and how a landlord is performing 
in relation to rent collection. 

We also commented that there should be an additional measure 
recording the outcomes to ASB cases. 
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Agree 

No further comments 

 

Agree 

There should be no restrictions to enable a landlord to engage 
with their tenants in a number of accessible formats, determined 
by the makeup of its tenants. 
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Disagree  

We feel that the minimum sample sizes will fail to gather a 
breadth of feedback. Therefore, we propose that 20% minimum 
survey responses will give greater transparency of landlord 
performance. 

 

Disagree 

The reporting year should be standard from 1st April to 31 March 
to ensure that publication can be unified and those tenants with 
Landlords of more than 1,000 homes are not waiting for results. 
This should be a consistent approach for all. 
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Agree 

However please list in the guidance (not exhaustive) the sources 
of regulatory intelligence 

 

Yes 
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Yes 

 

As highlighted in the Regulatory Impact Assessment the 
implementation of the tenant perception survey and TSMs will 
require each landlord to budget and allocate resources to the set 
up and readiness for data collection. 2022/23 budgets have 
been set and costs incurred will require offsetting against other 
priorities. 

We note that ongoing costs will be significantly less than the 
initial set up costs but this Council believes that new burdens 
funding for the first year set up costs would be a welcome 
support to landlords who will be required to divert funding away 
from existing services to tenants to fund the change. 

 


